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PHENOMENAL AND NONPAREIL
Jagran Social Welfare Society, Bhopal 
is promoted by Shri Hari Mohan Gupta 
along with the other members of the 
Society with the ideology and thoughts 
of its inspiration and fatherly figure Late 
Shri Guru Dev Gupta in the year 1997. 
The primary objective of the Society is 
to develop and propagate educational 
programs by the way of establishing 
progressive schools, colleges, universities 
or other educational institutions in India 
which will be open to all without any 

distinction of race, caste or creed and 
other social welfare objectives of the 
community.

In the last 16 years of its operations, 
the Society has carved a niche in the 
state of Madhya Pradesh for itself and 
has set new benchmarks by providing 
quality education to more than 35,000 
students since its inception. The Society 
is focused on making quality education 
more accessible and affordable so that 
many more students can pursue their 
dream of excellence.

DISSEMINATING VALUES AND 
RIGHTEOUSNESS
Jagran Social Welfare Society thinks of 
education as the means of developing 
greatest abilities, which allows 
communities to benefit from it and aids 
in the strengthening of the nation. The 
Society is dedicated towards creating 
an ecosystem where students’ absolute 
character is moulded with the value of 
knowledge instilled in their minds. This 
objective is being achieved by operating 
3 branches of Delhi Public School under 
the aegis of Delhi Public School Society, 
New Delhi. Out of these 3 schools, 2 are 

run in Bhopal and 1 in Indore.
Further, the Society ventured into 

higher education in 2009 by establishing 
two institutions of distinction. Moving 
forward in 2013, Jagran Lakecity 
University (JLU) came into existence 
which is approved by the Government 
of Madhya Pradesh and University 
Grants Commission, Govt. of India. The 
University follows the similar learning 
pedagogy practiced in other institutions 
of JSWS to create the same impact on 
University-level students. Moreover, the 
career-oriented degrees offered at JLU 
lay emphasis on global perspectives so 
that students can access the coveted 
opportunities on international platform.

NATION & HUMANITY FIRST
With the goal of well-being of the entire 
humanity at the core of its philosophies, 
Jagran Social Welfare Society develops 
knowledge with compassion, love and 
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•	 Awarded “Highest 
Spender in CSR – 
Medium Scale” by 
Govt. of MP

•	 Mr. Hari Mohan Gupta 
felicitated as an 
Education Evangelist 
of India

QUANTUM LEAPS
morality. The Society acts with integrity 
to create constant value sustainability of 
the same. It has contributed sensitively 
and sensibly towards the growth of 
Society and exerts with passion to build 
a foundation for the leaders of tomorrow.

Believing that the nation and society 
prosper when the students succeed, 
Jagran Social Welfare Society is spreading 
higher standards of education from 
Nursery to PhD and helping the youth of 
the country to realize their dreams and 
contribute towards the economic and 
social development of the country.

GIVING BACK TO THE 
COMMUNITY
Jagran Social Welfare Society, driven 
by its core values to impart education 
to all sections of society established 
“Shiksha Kendras” which nurture its 
mission to kindle the light of literacy for 
less-fortunate children living in slums 
and orphanages. The Society believes 
that education is the basic right of every 
human being and to spread quality 
education is the moral duty of every 
citizen.

Shiksha Kendras are an integral part of 
JSWS and is a platform through which 
the Society aims to provide education 
to underprivileged children to learn, 
explore and experiment, thus helping 
them to evolve as responsible, confident 
and self-reliant individuals who can 
prove to be an asset to the nation.


